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PERSONAL INFORMATION  
 

 14, Papazahariou Str., Athens, 17362, Greece  

 +30 2109858156     +30 6972282722        

 th.styliadis@gmail.com  

Sex Male | Date of birth 04/10/1987 | Nationality Hellenic (Greek)  

 

 

WORK EXPERIENCE  
  

 
  

 

POSITION Maritime Economist, Researcher 

10/2022-present Academic Scholar  

University of Piraeus, Department of Maritime Studies: https://maritime-unipi.gr/ 

▪ Courses:  Port Environmental Management (3rd Semester), Ocean Governance and Maritime 
Industries (Elective Course)  

 
Academic Teaching   

 

1/2022-present Management Consultant  

OASA (Transport for Athens):  https://www.oasa.gr/ 

▪ Urban Transport System Diagnostics 

▪ Ιnvolved in the preparation and writing of managerial, strategy and business plan reports  

▪ Collaboration with public and private stakeholders for the promotion of research & investment 
projects 

▪ Support CEO in day-to-day management 
 
Urban Transport  

 

11/2021-present Transport Analyst (Contractor) 

Support to Bosnia and Herzegovina in upgrading Framework Transport Strategy and related 
documents. Polinde:    https://www.polinde.gr/ 

▪ Transport System Diagnostics 

▪ Analysis of the Intermodal Sector in BiH (Transport Network, Sector Performance)  

▪ Analysis of the Inland Waterway Sector in BiH (Transport Network, Sector Performance) 

▪ Safety & Security Analysis of the Transport Network 

▪ Data Collection, Cleansing & Analysis  
 
Policy Research Project: (Contract No 2021/426-545) 
 

                                11/2020-present Economic Researcher, Team Member 

 Port Link 
 

▪ Involved in the creation and utilization of a set of indicators stemming from the port industry to 
promote sustainability (economic, social, environmental) 

▪ Involved in the preparation and writing of managerial, dissemination and R&D deliverables within the 
context of the project 

▪ Aggregation of primary and secondary data sets, data processing and analysis in Excel & SPSS 
 

 Research Project – Port Sector  
 

https://maritime-unipi.gr/
https://www.oasa.gr/
https://www.polinde.gr/
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1/2021- 10/2021 Part-Time Editor 

Naftika Chronika,  www.naftikachronika.gr 

▪ Publishing articles and news on maritime shipping, ports, logistics, multimodal and inland transport 

Media Publications 

9/2018-9/2019 Economic Consultant  

National Documentation Center : “Knowledge Bridges”  https://www.ekt.gr/en/index 

▪ Mapping of the Greek community migrating abroad; 

▪ Establishing “Bridges” amongst Greek scientists and entrepreneurs residing in Greece & Abroad; 

▪ Economic quantification of the brain drain phenomenon for the Greek economy; 

▪ Working on the establishment of initiatives for reversing the phenomenon of brain drain: organization 
of Scientific & Business Cooperation awards (Knowledge-Bridges Awards 
https://awards.knowledgebridges.gr/); 

▪ Data Analysis of Surveys targeted to the Greek scientific and research community domestically and 
abroad (Ph.d holders, candidates, MSc students participating in Research Actions). 

Public Organization - Research  

9/2018-9/2019 Economic Consultant to the General Secretary 

Secretariat for Strategic and Private Investments - Greek Ministry of Economy and Development 

▪ Economic Evaluation of Strategic Investments’ proposals; 

▪ Member of Team developing legislative actions and initiatives concerning the enhancement of 
economic activity of the Less Economic Developed Regions in Greece, the issue of Brain Drain, the 
reformulation of the coordination and investment promotion framework (with OECD), the support of 
SME’s (with Chambers of Trade & Commerce, National Documentation Center etc.); 

▪ Statistical analysis and progress evaluation of the implementation of the National Development Law; 

▪ Aggregation of Data and Creation of an Investment Index since 2015; 

▪ Assisted General Secretary on his day-to-day management (economic figures, interviews, articles, 
meetings with state and private parties). 

Ministry – Public Organization  

10/2014-2/2018 Freelance Economic Researcher and Consultant 
▪ Prepared syllabus, teaching and evaluation material on behalf of The Hellenic Confederation of 

Commerce and Entrepreneurship (ESEE) and its program “Training and Certification of Unemployed 
Workforce in developing sectors” for the position of Logistician (December 2016 – January 2017); 

▪ Participated as a Team Member on behalf of the Greek Regulatory Authority for Ports and in 
cooperation with the University of Aegean, in the research proposal “Merging prospects for 
Municipal, Intermunicipal and State Port Funds”. The study aimed to provide a holistic proposal for 
the redevelopment of Greek Port Funds through mergers, relevant policies and legislative 
suggestions. (January - February, 2016); 

▪ Participated in the EU funded project TrainMos II (European education program at Academic level) 
as an instructor, preparing and offering lectures in various sessions intended to make new post-
graduates more aware of the challenges of the multi-modal transport sector. (October - December 
2015); 

▪ Participated as a Team Member on behalf of the Office of the Vice President of the Greek 
Government in the research project “The Port and Transport Cluster of Piraeus and Thriasio”. The 
study identified and evaluated the competitive characteristics of the Piraeus Port and of Thriasio 
Logistics Center in view of the competitive bidding procedures for their concession to foreign 
investors. (April - July, 2015); 

▪ Developed certification manuals and creation of a question test pool for TUV Hellas, for the positions 
of logistics and warehouse manager, supply chain manager and logistician (February - June, 2015). 
 

Multidisciplinary Research 
 
 
 
 

http://www.naftikachronika.gr/
https://www.ekt.gr/en/index
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10/2014-6/2015 Research Analyst, Team Member, 

MEDITA – “MEDiterranean Information Traffic Application” Med Programme - European Regional 
Development Fund 2013-2015 

▪ Collecting, collating and carrying out complex trade flow data analysis in support of management 
requests. Traffic monitoring and optimization research. Establishing close cooperation with project 
partners. Also involved in the development of the “Observatory for traffic flows” for the modelling of 
Mediterranean flows, by designing the website functionalities and selecting the appropriate KPIs. 
(Project Coordinator: University of Piraeus Research Centre; the Total budget of the Project is € 2,5 
Million Euros) 

Research Project -Transport Sector 

11/2013-6-2014 Research Associate 

Decision Dynamics Ltd Management Consultants 

▪ Responsible for preparing management, dissemination and R&D reports for European Research 
Projects: Contain, MESA & EMar. Supplied qualitative and quantitative data in support of 
management and customer requests. Manipulated, cleansed & processed data using Excel, SPSS 
and Eviews 

Economic Consultants – Project Management 

10/2010-4/2011 Economic Advisor (intern) 

ILPAP S.A Trolley Buses (absorbed in OSY) https://www.osy.gr/ 

▪ Involved in strategic planning and development plans of ILPAP (trolley buses). Participated actively 
in the reorganization of the company’s spare parts warehouse though suggestions and 
recommendations that minimized inventory costs. Collected passenger flow data for all trolley lines. 

▪ Elaborated a survey evaluating the economic sustainability of ILPAP lines and devised a strategic 
plan their reorganization 

Urban Transport 

6/2009-9/2009 Junior Sales Manager (Intern) 

MM PUBLICATIONS – E. MOUTSOU & CO  

▪ Promoted and Consulted customers on ELT Books & Multimedia. Participated in dissemination and 
promotion activities such as International Book Fairs in Greece and abroad.  
 

ELT Books & Multimedia 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

https://www.osy.gr/
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PERSONAL SKILLS 
  

 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

EDUCATION AND TRAINING   

  

2013 – 2022 
 
 
 
 
 

                                     2011 – 2012 
 
 
 
 
 
 
                                      2005 - 2010 
 
 

PhD Graduate 
University of Piraeus, Department of Maritime Studies 
 
▪ Ph.D Title: Concentration in the Port Industry: Alliances, Innovations & Synergies for the development 
of door-to-door logistics  
 

M.Sc. in Maritime Economics & Logistics (Graduated with distinction) 
Erasmus University of Rotterdam, Department of Maritime Economics & Logistics 
 
▪ Major: Supply chain Management, Maritime Logistics, Management Science, Transport & 
Regional Economics, Shipping Finance, International Economics, Marine Innovation, (#Courses: 
13, Thesis: B+) 

B.Sc. in International and European Economic Relations Direction degree 
Democritus University of Thrace, Department of Economics 
 
▪ Major: International Economics, Courses Included: Economics, Business Administration, 
Mathematics, Statistics, Econometrics, Transportation Economics, Marketing (#Courses: 56)  
 

Mother tongue(s) Greek 

  

Other language(s) 
UNDERSTANDING  SPEAKING  WRITING  

Listening  Reading  Spoken interaction  Spoken production   

English C2 C2 C2 C2 C2 

French B1 B1 B1 B1 B1 

Digital skills 
SELF-ASSESSMENT 

Information 
processing 

Communication 
Content 
creation 

Safety Problem solving 

 Proficient User Proficient User Proficient User Proficient User Proficient User 

 
ACTA: Ιnfotest Certified Basic User, (MS Word, MS Excel, MS Internet Explorer 11 & MS Outlook 2010 GR), 

 ▪ good command of office suite (word processor, spread sheet, presentation software) 

▪ good command of SPSS & Eviews 

▪ good command of e-learning programs (teams, ez-talks, e-class, zoom) 
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ADDITIONAL INFORMATION 
  

 

 

 

 

Publications 

 

▪ Styliadis, T., Angelopoulos, J., Leonardou, P., & Pallis, P. (2022). Promoting Sustainability through 
Assessment and Measurement of Port Externalities: A Systematic Literature Review and Future 
Research Paths. Sustainability, 14(14), 8403. 

▪ Chlomoudis, C & Styliadis, T. (2022). Innovation & Patenting in containerized liner shipping. 
Sustainability, 14 (2), pp. 1-18. https://doi.org/10.3390/su14020892 

▪ Styliadis, T. & Chlomoudis, C. (2021). Analysing the evolution of concentration within containerized 
transport chains through a circuitist approach: the role of innovations in accelerating the circuits of 
liner and container terminal operators. The Asian Journal of Shipping & Logistics, Open Access, p.p. 
1-8, https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ajsl.2021.09.002 

▪ Maravegias, N., Styliadis, Th. & Chrysomallidis, Ch. (2021). The Impact of Brexit to the Greek 
Maritime Cluster. Region & Periphery Issue 2021 (11), pp. 31-59 (in Greek); 

▪ Chlomoudis, C. & Styliadis Th. (2019). Concentration of container flows on the port phase: the case 
of the West and East Coast port ranges. Issues in Business Management and Economics Vol.7 (1), 
pp. 1-13; 

▪ Angelopoulos, J., Chlomoudis, C. and Styliadis Th. (2017). Effect of global supply chain 
developments on the governance of port regulation. In Pettit, S. & Beresford, A. (Eds.). Port 
Management: Cases in Port Geography, Operations and Policy (pp. 62-93). Kogan Page Publishers 

 

Conferences 

 

 

▪ Styliadis, T., Angelopoulos, J., Leonardou, P.  & Pallis, P. (2021). A Critical Review of Literature on 
Port Externalities: The Role of Indicators. Presented in the International Conference of Maritime 
Economists (IAME), Rotterdam, The Netherlands, 25 – 27 of November. 

▪ Pallis, P., Chlomoudis, C., Styliadis, T. & Tozidis, M. (2021). Segmentation Analysis of TEN-T Greek 
Ports.  Presented in the International Conference of Maritime Economists (IAME), Rotterdam, The 
Netherlands, 25 – 27 of November. 

▪ Chlomoudis, C. & Styliadis Th. (2020). Analysing the evolution of concentration within containerized 
transport chains through a circuitist approach: the role of innovations in accelerating the circuits of 
liner and container terminal operators. Presented in the International Conference of Maritime 
Economists (IAME), Hong Kong, China, 10-13 of June. 

▪ Chlomoudis, C. & Styliadis Th. (2018). Concentration of container flows on the port phase: the case 
of the West and East Coast port ranges. Presented in the International Conference of Maritime 
Economists (IAME), Mombasa, Kenya, 11-14 of September; 

▪ Chlomoudis, C. & Styliadis Th. (2018). Innovation and commercialization of technology among 
containerized transport actors. “The Jean Monnet symposium on the future of the European port 
policy”, Chios, Greece, 28-29 of June; 

▪ Styliadis Th. (2016). “Port City Relations: the role of port authorities as regulators”. 7th Panhellenic 
Conference of the Laboratory of Harbor Works, Athens, Greece. (In Proceedings); 

▪ Chlomoudis C.I & Styliadis Th. (2015). "A framework for the institutional governance of regulation 
and the regulatory tools at hand, in port services", ECONSHIP Conference, 2015, Chios Greece; 

Memberships 

 

▪ Economic Chamber of Greece;  

▪ Hellenic Association of Maritime Economists; 

▪ International Association of Maritime Economists (IAME); 

▪  MEL Alumni;  

▪ Uni.Pi. Students Association (Elected students’ representative in 2014). 

▪ Evaggeliki School Alumni 

Certificates 

 

▪ BIMCO Days” certificate,  

▪ I.C.S Certificate. 

https://doi.org/10.3390/su14020892
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ajsl.2021.09.002

